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IBE - rules and regs at the law firm of Winston and Strawn. Justice wanted to have banking and surance

experts take a look at it. They have should be done late this week or early next week.

Terrence - 1 have communicated with him every day. He has only provided invoices for 5130K and verified
payment of $12K. I have been asking him repeatedly for his bank statement which should suffice as evidence of

payment for the other S$108K.

Christensen/Ottley - Rich cut the check and it will be picked up this week.

Mapp - as I emailed to you previously, he and Celestino would like to meet with you in Thursday or Friday of

this week.

Note: the latest poll shows that Mapp is within the margin of error and 1t 15 looking more like a run off.

With warm regards,

Cecile de Jongh

Sent from my iPhone

On Oct 19, 2014, at 2:49 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@gmail.com> wrote:

idb terrance otley , map
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