
From: Gregory Riches 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@grnail.com> 

Cc: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Fwd: Fwd: Handrail Estimate from Dualoy Leather 

Date: Mon, 24 Nov 2014 18:46:01 +0000 
Attachments: Est_1639RF_from_Dualoy_Leather_3240.pdf 

Jeffrey, 
Attached is the invoice for the temporary leather stair rail. 
They can match the leather on the RL bag but not exactly on such short notice. 
When we do the final one it can be an exact match. 
Please let me know if you want to proceed with this? 
-Gregory 

Gregory Riches 
INTERIORS 
43 West 28th #3 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "andrew Feigin" 
Subject: Handrail Estimate from Dualoy Leather 
Date: November 24. 2014 1:35:10 PM EST 
To: c > 

EFTA00626155


