
From: Richard Kahn 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Wed, 26 Jun 2013 16:25:05 +0000 

Brice needs to explain JB Henderson walking off job as i am unaware of this 
JB Henderson was paid on 6-13-2013 however they say funds were never received 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York New York 10022 
tel 
fa 
cel 

On Jun 26, 2013, at 12:22 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

rich bamett said , that he did a comparions of the fire systems? and he said that brice told him that jb 
hendrson walked off the job as they weren't paid, ??? 
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