
From: 
To: "Je vacation" <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: Fw: GIV contract update 
Date: Sun, 17 Feb 2013 22:15:13 +0000 

Importance: Normal 

Jeffrey, 
I told Dennis I'll meet him at his office at Jet Aviation at 10:30am to discuss terms/contract. 
-thx 
Larry 
 Original Message 
From: Dennis Annderson 
To: Lawrence Visoski 
Subject: Re: GIV contract update 
Sent: Feb 17, 2013 4:59 PM 

I'll be at the office until 3. The price is 6.1, once we agree on that we will work out the terms and conditions. 

Dennis Andersen 
561-352-6615 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Feb 17, 2013, at 4:51 PM, " ' <la wrote: 

> Hi Dennis, 
> they are not able to be separated. Are you suggesting 6.1M with our terms , ? or 6.1 with yours. why don't you 
and I sit together tomorrow and see if we can work something out. 
> Will you be at Jet Aviation tomorrow? I depart at 4pm to New York in GII with Jeffrey. 
> Thx 
> Larry 

 Original Message 
> From: Dennis Annderson 
> To: Lawrence Visoski 
> Subject: Re: GIV contract update 
> Sent: Feb 17, 2013 8:29 AM 

> Larry, if he agrees to the 6.1 purchase we can get the contract terms resolved but before I go any further you 
need to let me know about price. 

> Dennis Andersen 
> Florida Jet Sales, Inc. 
> Office: 
> Mobile 

> Sent from my iPad 

> On Feb 17, 2013, at 8:23 AM, "Larry Visoski" c wrote: 

EFTA00627162



> 
» 
» Dennis, 
>> The lawyers need an agreement with respect to Pre-Buy and believes that if you guys walk away for any 
reason, we should not have to pay the expense of the Pre-Buy, seams fair since ASC 488 is approx $135,000.00, 
that only leaves $65,000 before you can walk. Does not seem right, please send me an agreeable pre-buy and 
contract. 
» 
>> Sent from my iPad 
> 
> Sent via BlackBeny by AT&T 

Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 
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