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To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Thu, 02 Oct 2014 12:44:16 +0000 

Will do. Karyna and I are meeting at the apartments on saturday and I've 
already spoken to Rich. 
Thanks, G 
On Oct 2, 2014, at 8:27 AM, "jeffrey E." <jeela®gmail.com> wrote: 

please coordinate with karyna and sue . orders tiing and rich kahn will pay. 
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