From: LSJ GS) < -
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com>
Subject: Re:
Date: Wed, 08 Feb 2017 11:12:36 +0000

Ok will look what we have, 1f nothing there will see what Home Depot has in stock
Sent from my iPhone

On Feb 8, 2017, at 7:07 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@ gmail.com™ wrote:

something like ; http:/'www.homedepot.com/p/MOEN-Velocity-2-Spray-8-in-Rainshower-Showerhead-
Featuring-Ilmmersion-in-Chrome-56320/202960681

On Wed, Feb 8, 2017 at 7:03 AM, LSJ GSJ <[ NG - o'

Danny blew out line, will get him to review pan level
No shower head arrived on plane there are a couple of different ones on Cost U Less but not like existing
Please advise

Sent from my iPhone

On Feb 8, 2017, at 6:54 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@ gmail.com> wrote:

living room air con pan? still dripping. please change out master shower head
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