
From: Lesley Groff <Ma> 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Cc: Rich Kahn , Illa 

Subject: Re: Peggy Siegal 
Date: Thu, 02 Aug 2012 14:18:13 +0000 

ok, thanks... 
FYI- while I was on the phone with Allison and Peggy, Peggy told Allison to "just pay it...wire the money and 
pay it or have Brian pay it and get Jeffrey to reimburse me..." 

On Aug 2, 2012, at 10:15 AM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

tell her i will be able to call in about three hours. 

On Thu, Aug 2, 2012 at 8:09 AM, Lesley Groff <1   wrote: 
Please call Peggy Siegal as soon as possible. She called the office asking to talk with you...you can reach her 
through her office. She wants to speak with you now. 
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