
From: Jeffrey <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Wed, 16 May 2012 12:12:49 +0000 

Yes 

Sony for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone 

On May 15, 2012, at 2:06 PM, Richard Kahn <richardkahn12®gmail.com> wrote: 

> I spoke with last night and informed her that services are no longer needed 
> She conceded that this task was very difficult 
> Is it ok to pay her last invoice for the period April 16th thru May 15th for $4,000 plus $604 (press releases) 
totaling $4,604? 

> Richard Kahn 
> HBRK Associates Inc. 

> tel 
> fax 
> cel 

EFTA00630272


