
From: Lvjet C 

To: jeevaeat ion(c/gmail.com, 

Subject: Fwd: N9OIRL Bell 430 

Date: Wed, 07 Mar 2012 04:54:07 +0000 

Attachments: 20120305133926481.pdf; 20120305133918551.pdf 

Jeffrey, 
I would like your approval to wire 50% payment to PremiAir for Bell 430 maintenance work: Annual inspection, tail rotor blade, 
auto pilot servos,. 
$81,255.37 
is this approved for Rich to Wire the funds? 
see attached for itemized work detail,. 
thank you, 
Larry 

 Original Message 
From: Mike Preston < 
To: Lvjet < 
Cc: Crai. Lammiman < 

Sent: Mon, Mar 5, 2012 9:03 am 
Subject: RE: N901 RL Bell 430 

Hi Larry 

; Gordon Potter < >; paecommercial 

As per your email below please see attached Pro Forma Invoice copy as we discussed. I can confirm that 50% 
downpayment as per the attached 
Is acceptable to us to start work and we copy and understand the urgency on the Auto Pilot Servo issue. 

Please don't hesitate to contact us if you require any further information. 

Best regards 
Mike 

Mike Preston 
Director, Engineering & Maintenance 
PremiAir Aircraft Engineering 

From: Lvjet mailto• 
Sent: 05 March 2012 03:02 
To: Mike Preston; Craig Lammiman; Gordon Potter 
Subject: N901RL Bell 430 

Hello Mike and Craig,. 
Can you forward me an invoice for maintenance work / annual inspection to be accomplished on Bell 430 
N901RL? I want to get wire transfer instructions also to PremiAir to get your payment started? Mike, I believe 50% 
payment is acecpable to you to start the work? 
really like to get the Auto Pilot servos fedex to Bell for quick return ASAP,. 

best regards, 

Larry Visoski, Cheif Pilot 
Hyperion Air, Inc. 
3800 Southern Blvd. suite 204 
West Palm Beach, Florida, USA 33406 

EFTA00630436



cell 

PremiAir Aircraft Engineering Ltd is a limited company registered in England and Wales. 
Registered number: 1128286. Registered office: Sixth Floor, 90 Fetter Lane, London EC4A 

iG Please consider the environment before printing this email 
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