
From: Richard Kahn 
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 

Subject: Poly Pavement 
Date: Tue, 28 Apr 2015 14:30:47 +0000 

attached below Danny says we need to cover approximately 3000 sq ft for portion of road you requested we start 
with 

Each 55 gallon drum covers 2200 sq ft with a 2" depth and costs 1500 per drum 
Shipping also needs to be included from CA to FL then Tropical (est cost 600) 
Time frame to receive on STT is 16-18 days 

Total projected Cost for 2 Drums = 3,600 

Another item we will need to lay material is: 
1) Purchase or rent a rototiller attachment (approx cost 1700 plus shipping) 
We will need to do more research and receive input from staff to determine best unit to purchase 
http://www.drpower.com/power-equipment/roto-tillers/ 

Please advise if ok to proceed with purchase of two 55 gallon drums 
Thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 212-971-1306 
fax 646-350-0954 
cell 917-414-7584 

Begin forwarded message: 

Date: April 28, 2015 at 10:04:31 AM EDT 
From: Danny Vicars 
Reply-To: Danny Vicars 
To: Daphne Wallace 
Cc: ann rodriquez < 
Subject: Re: Fwd: 

>, Rich Kahn 

hello everbody square footage from gate to gym 3000ft a 1gal pail does 40sq ft that would be 75 pails or 15 5gal 
pails 
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On Monday, April 27, 2015 7:28 PM, Daphne Wallace c lia> wrote: 

Good night to all :) DW 
On Apr 27, 2015 7:27 PM, "Danny Vicars" <I > wrote: 

yes I like him and what I read i'll have square footage quick tomorrow but I still need at least 7 to 10 days of 
digging U putting a ditch right up the middle of road ??? don't know when I can Finnish ?? had to close it up 
today for arrival ??? ok done im going to cook and sleep 

On Monday, April 27, 2015 7:20 PM, Daphne Wallace > wrote: 

Greetings Danny, yes Rich and I spoke to Ron Reed today to try to get pricing and timeline ready 
to fit with your assessment and measurements so we can move as quickly as possible on this. Did 
you get a good feeling about the product? DW 
On Apr 27, 2015 7:16 PM, "Danny Vicars" <I > wrote: 

funny stuff just got off phone with pollypavement after he took all my info he said are you with daphne 
anyways got a lot of good info and we'll need to do some extra work on road a better subbase something that 
we can compact like crusher run material it needs to be at least 3 inches thick then compact it then put his 
product down I can figure out how much crusher run we would need and price it out its a cheep material right 
from hmi 

On Monday, April 27, 2015 2:42 PM, Daphne Wallace c > wrote: 

Perfect Danny - we appreciate it, Daphne 

On Mon, Apr 27, 2015 at 1:37 PM, Danny Vicars < > wrote: 
let me read the specs again and measure road do you mind I get to this 2morrow realy behind right now 
with early arrival 

On Monday, April 27, 2015 1:28 PM, Daphne Wallace c > wrote: 

Greetings Danny, 

How much of the product do you suggest we order for the Gym road? DW 

On Mon, Apr 27, 2015 at 12:19 PM, Danny Vicars < > wrote: 
it sounds great if its everything it says it is plus the boss new path he said he wants it invisible 

On Monday, April 27, 2015 10:58 AM, Daphne Wallace > wrote: 

Greetings Danny, 

JE would like to try a Poly Pavement product on the road past the Gym. He has supplied a 
link to the product and the Company that makes the product - see below. 
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Can you please review the product and give us feedback. JE has asked that this be 
expedited so he can make a decision on his upcoming Paving Project. 

Kind regards, Daphne 

Forwarded message
From: Jeffrey E. < 
Date: Sat, Apr 25, 2015 at 5:48 AM 
Subject: 
To: Richard Kahn < 

>, Daphne Wallace < 

lets try some 

>, ann rodriquez 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to I , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

On Monday, April 27, 2015 10:58 AM, Daphne Wallace > wrote: 

Greetings Danny, 

> 

JE would like to try a Poly Pavement product on the road past the Gym. He has supplied a 
link to the product and the Company that makes the product - see below. 

Can you please review the product and give us feedback. JE has asked that this be 
expedited so he can make a decision on his upcoming Paving Project. 

Kind regards, Daphne 

 Forwarded message 
From: jeffrey E. leevacation@gmail.com>
Date: Sat, Apr 25, 2015 at 5:48 AM 
Subject: 
To: Richard Kahn < 

>, Daphne Wallace < 
>, ann rodriquez 

> 
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lets try some 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

On Monday, April 27, 2015 2:42 PM, Daphne Wallace c > wrote: 

Perfect Danny - we appreciate it, Daphne 

On Mon, Apr 27, 2015 at 1:37 PM, Danny Vicars < > wrote: 
let me read the specs again and measure road do you mind I get to this 2morrow realy behind right now 
with early arrival 

On Monday, April 27, 2015 1:28 PM, Daphne Wallace c > wrote: 

Greetings Danny, 

How much of the product do you suggest we order for the Gym road? DW 

On Mon, Apr 27, 2015 at 12:19 PM, Danny Vicars < > wrote: 
it sounds great if its everything it says it is plus the boss new path he said he wants it invisible 

On Monday, April 27, 2015 10:58 AM, Daphne Wallace > wrote: 

Greetings Danny, 

JE would like to try a Poly Pavement product on the road past the Gym. He has supplied a 
link to the product and the Company that makes the product - see below. 
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Can you please review the product and give us feedback. JE has asked that this be 
expedited so he can make a decision on his upcoming Paving Project. 

Kind regards, Daphne 

 Forwarded message 
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Date: Sat, Apr 25, 2015 at 5:48 AM 
Subject: 
To: Richard Kahn < >, ann rodriquez 

>, Daphne Wallace <I

lets try some 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

On Monday, April 27, 2015 10:58 AM, Daphne Wallace > wrote: 

Greetings Danny, 

> 

JE would like to try a Poly Pavement product on the road past the Gym. He has supplied a 
link to the product and the Company that makes the product - see below. 

Can you please review the product and give us feedback. JE has asked that this be 
expedited so he can make a decision on his upcoming Paving Project. 

Kind regards, Daphne 

 Forwarded message 
From: jeffrey E. leevacation@gmail.com>
Date: Sat, Apr 25, 2015 at 5:48 AM 
Subject: 
To: Richard Kahn < 

>, Daphne Wallace < 
>, ann rodriquez 

> 
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lets try some 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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