From: Eileen Alexanderson *’4_
To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@gmail.com=>
CC: Richard Joslin <[ -
Subject: Re:
Date: Sat, 25 Oct 2014 02:27:44 0000

We have $10mil on the schedule in Dec. 15 the January a new commitment?
Sent from my iPhone

On Oct 24, 2014, at 8:16 PM, "jeffrey E." <jeevacation/@ gmail com> wrote:

there is also 21 mililion dollars in charitble contributions missing, 1 million next week 10 million in dec and
10 million in january,
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