
From: Richard Kahn

To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: CONFIDENTIAL 

Date: Thu, 21 Jul 2016 17:21:45 +0000 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Martin Weinberg < 
Subject: Re: CONFIDENTIAL 
Date: July 20, 2016 at 10:35:34 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn < 

Thanks Richard 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jul 20, 2016, at 7:50 PM, Richard Kahn < 

thank you for sending note 
i am currently reviewing all outstanding bills and will be in touch 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

wrote: 

On Jul 18, 2016, at 9:27 AM, Martin G. Weinberg < > wrote: 

Richard, payment on an invoice sent on May 3 for April legal fees remains outstanding. The June invoice for May was 
paid. Can you advise, thanks, Marty 
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Martin G Weinberg PC 
20 Park Plaza 
Suite 1000 
Boston, MA 02116 
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