
From: Richard Kahn
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: 
Date: Wed, 04 Feb 2015 22:56:12 +0000 

attached says money is due 4 weeks after contract is signed... 
not sure if that was done or will occur in May or June 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York NY 10022 
tel 
fax
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Admissions Team cadmissionsemail@hackreactor.com>
Date: January 28, 2015 at 12:50:59 PM EST 
Subject: Re: {Accountin Re: Admissions decision from Hack Reactor 
To: Richard Kahn < 

Hi Richard, 

Nevermind about the recepit. Please just let us know when the payment has been sent over. 

We will talk with our Accounting team to make sure the full payments there. 

Warmly, 
The Admissions Team 

On Wed, Jan 28, 2015 at 5:57 AM, Richard Kahn < 
i am not sure what you mean by sending a receipt for transaction 
please call me 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax
cell 

wrote: 
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On Jan 27, 2015, at 12:37 PM, Admissions Team <admissionsemail(Thehackreactor.com> wrote: 

Hello Rich, 

No if you could please just add her name to the transfer. 

Also, sending a screenshot, or a receipt, for the transaction to this email address will be necessary for our 
admissions team to reserve her space in the class. 

Thank you! 

Warmly, 
The Admissions Team 

On Tue, Jan 27, 2015 at 5:08 AM, Richard Kahn <1 
Thank you 
I will send wire tomorrow am for 2,000 
Does MI have a ID If I should put on wire reference 

Thanks 

Rich 

From: Admissions Team <admissionsemail@hackreactor.com>
Date: Monday, January 26, 2015 at 6:01 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: (Accounting) Re: Admissions decision from Hack Reactor 

Hey Richard, 

cna 

> wrote: 

$2,000 must be paid upfront when IM signs her Student Enrollment Contract. This will fully reserve her space in the 
class. 

The remaining $15,780 will be due 4 weeks after she has signed the contract. 

Warmly, 
The Admissions Team 

On Mon, Jan 26, 2015 at 1:lIl PM, Richard Kahn > wrote: 
Luiz, 

i am going to arrange payment for tuition 
please advise what 17,780 comprises? 
can it be paid in installments or must it all be paid upfront 

thank you 
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Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Forwarded message 
From: 
Date: Mon, Jan 26, 2015 at 2:26 PM 
Subject: Fwd: {Accounting} Re: Admissions decision from Hack Reactor 
To: "Jeffrey Epstein (jeevacation@gmail.com)" <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Jeffrey, I'm forwarding the bank information for Hackreactor. The full tuition is $17780. Please, let me know when 
the payment is send, so I can contact them again to make sure that they receive it and reserved my spot. 

Thank you again for doing this.lt means a lot to me. 

On Mon, Jan 26, 2015 at 9:01 AM, Luis Guzman •:: > wrote: 
You can wire us the tuition to: 

Bank: Chase Bank 
Account holder: Hack Reactor LLC ( 944 Market Street 8th Floor, San Francisco, CA 94102) 
Location: 1201 Market St., San Francisco, CA 94103 

Let me know if you have any questions. 

Best, 
Luis Guzman 
Accounting 

On Thu, Jan 22, 2015 at 1:59 PM, Admissions Team <admissionsemail@hackreactor.com> wrote: 
Hi MI 

We are excited to say that we would like to welcome you to join our June 29th program. Congratulations! 
We look forward to coding and learning a ton together. 

Your spot in the class will be reserved once we receive your deposit and signed Student Enrollment 
Agreement. I'll send you an email in the next few minutes with the agreement (including details about 
tuition payment deadlines) and the form to pay your deposit via credit or debit card. 
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Once enrolled, you should be all set until about eight weeks before the first day of class. We'll contact you to 
give you more information and access to required precourse work at that point. 

For more information about changing start dates, precourse curriculum, and tuition issues. Please see our 
Admitted Students FAQ: 

https://docs.google.com/a/hackreactor.com/document/d/liscOlAIBwW8Imm0fa- adUN.IzOVXDeNFOlp94-
XN2XrQ 

We're looking forward to having you in our class. Please let me know if you have any other questions. 

Warmly, 
The Admissions Team 

Luis Guzman 
Director of Operations & Employee Services 
Hack Reactor 
Github / Twitter / G+/ Linkedln 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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