From: Eric Roth <[ -
To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation(wgmail.com=
Subject: Re:
Date: Mon, 11 May 2015 09:54:32 +0000

Good moming Jeffrey,
I hope you enjoyed the weekend.
As requested, [ am following up on the outstanding balance / payment.

Eric

Best regards,

Eric

Eric H. Roth, President
International Jet Interiors

www.intljet.com

On May &, 2015, at 7:15 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@gmail.com> wrote:

vou are right , 1m in bed today send me aother note on monday please

On Fri, May 8, 2015 at 6:59 AM, Eric Roth <]} - v ote:

Good moming Jeffrey,

Hope all 15 well.

You have had an outstanding balance with us for a very long time and [ am not sure why.
I know that you always have a lot going on, but can you please authorize Rich to pay us?
Thank you.

Warm regards,

Eric

Eric H. Roth, President
International Jet Interiors

EFTA00634332



www.intljet.com

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 15 the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use. disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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