From: Eileen Alexanderson <[ R
To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@gmail.com™>
Subject: Re:
Date: Sat. 25 Oct 2014 02:18:02 0000

Will be in his month end pay check.
Sent from my iPhone

On Oct 24, 2014, at 8:14 PM, "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail com=> wrote:

leon agreed to immedilaty give Joslin 50 k bonus and raise his salary to 400k  thanks
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