From: Jeevacation <jeevacation{@gmail.com=>

To: Gary Kerney <[

Ce: Rich Kahn <
Subject: Re: Stephen
Date: Fri, 26 Feb 2010 15:40:51 0000

Ok

Sent from my iPhone

On Feb 26, 2010, at 10:31 AM, "Gary Kerney" _‘J’ wrote:

| understand you'r not happy with how we got here but he does have something of value on his desk today that we need,and

| can get that out of him in the next two or three weeks.Dejongue can finish it up.

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Fri 2/26/2010 10:26 AM

To: Gary Kerney

Subject: Re: Stephen

Im ok with that in general gary, but it is relly not fair that since june 1 have asked for things |, msi was paid,
nothing has been built. 1 not only gave him a job, as per jerry , even though he was to be paid only 100 k, if he
stayed at landmark, [ have been more than fair. 1 have no master plan, no irrigation , no superviosr, no road

layout , no overlays. 1 want to be fair, rich how much have we paid since inception including msi

On Fri, Feb 26, 2010 at 10:19 AM, Gary Kemey _':' wrote:

Jeffrey

Rich told me that you paid Landmark for me only.Stephen is due to come in next weelk If he is not going to be paid he
should not come and i have a problem with how we proceed with CZM and the site work.| think we should pay him thru

march which should get us thru the submittal then let him go.Lets talk.

Gary
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The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and 1s intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments.
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