
From: 
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Dr Magnani 
Date: Thu, 29 Jan 2015 10:21:51 +0000 

Attachments: SHBRK_Scann15012816211.pdf 

Dear Jeffrey , Magnani sent the office this invoice. It is $645 total and was for me to have my teeth cleaned and a 
filling redone. Would it be ok for Bella to pay it? 
Thank you xo 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: bellaklein 
Date: 28, 2015 at 8:50:57 PM GMT 
To: 
Subject: Dr Magnani 

M, please confirm your visit and procedure with Dr. Magnani. Please provide JE approval. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 212-971-1307 

Begin forwarded message: 

To: 
Subject: Messa e from KMBT C253 
From: 
Reply-To: scanner@hbrkassociates.com 
Date: January 28, 2015 at 3:21:31 PM EST 

EFTA00638122


