
From: 
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Programming bootcamp 
Date: Thu, 29 Jan 2015 16:23:43 +0000 

Hi Jeffrey, sorry to bother you. Did you had a chance to send payment to Hackreactor? I sent their wire info on 
Monday. 

Thank you, 

On Sun, Jan 25, 2015 at 3:25 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 
we should pay the school directly please send info 

On Fri, Jan 23, 2015 at 2:11 PM, > wrote: 
As I understand I have to sing the agreement and put a deposit asap. The rest of the tuition will have to be 
paid within 4 weeks. I propose starting now. I think if I don't reserve now, they will push me to later classes. 
My class already starts later than I hoped it would be - June 29th until around Oct 1st. It is very good 
program and I guess they in high demand. 

Thank you again for your financial support and letting me stay at your guest apartment in nyc. It was 
exciting, stress free and relaxing. I'm very grateful to you, because I was able to enjoy my life without 
worries. It is rare treat these days. 

On Fri, Jan 23, 2015 at 2:48 AM, Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 
when would you propose starting, glad ny worked out well fro you 

On Thu, Jan 22, 2015 at 7:13 PM, 
Jeffrey, 

> wrote: 

After long studying and preparation, I have been accepted to Hackreactor bootcamp. I'm very excited to 
participate in the program and believe it will help me launch a successful tech startup. 

The full tuition is $17,780. In order to reserve my spot they require: sign a student enrollment 
agreement, deposit of $2000, and the rest (15,780) have to be paid within 4 weeks after signing by check 
or wire. All payable to Hack Reactor, LLC. 

Please let me know if you still want to support me with this endeavor and I will send more details. 

Thank you, 

On Mon, Dec 8, 2014 at 2:06 PM, Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 
yes 

On Mon, Dec 8, 2014 at 4:44 PM, 
Jeffrey, 

wrote: 
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The bridge tournament is over and I had an amazing experience. Thank you for wiring 7k which 
enable me to attend the tournament. And thank you for letting me stay in your guest apartment. I 
will be here until morning of Dec 11th. 

I want to confirm if your offer paying for the programming bootcamp still stands. I'm thinking to 
apply to school this month or at the beginning of the next month. If I get accepted, the tuition for 12 
weeks program is 17,780. I would like to know if you still want to do that. 

Information about the programming bootcamp can be found here: 
http://www.hackreactor.com/program/

Thank you, 
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