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I don't know but I've paid 3000 euros for my rent ( December-January) on the 22nd 

I venerdi 8 gennaio 2016, jeffrey E. < > ha scritto: 
how much is left. you will now have to be responsible and keep track 

On Fri, Jan 8, 2016 at 2:52 PM, > wrote: 
Right.. 

II venerdi 8 gennaio 2016, jeffrey E. < > ha scritto: 
I assume you are out of money soon? 
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