
From: Richard Kahn 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jecvacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Giacontetti terms 
Date: Mon, 25 Sep 2017 16:57:14 4.0000 

Attachments: "Ilte_Hinse_Trust_remittance_25.09.17.pdf 

wire was received today 

00!25!2017 12:44 PM (ET) INCOMING MONEY TRANSFER $11.538,544.40 

haze trust received wire today 51 1.536.544 on 50% of giacometti at exchange rate of 1.35215 x 8,532,000 pounds 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 'Weaver. Cecilia" < 
Subject: RE: Glacomettl terms 
Date: September 25. 2017 at 12:00:45 PM EDT 
To: 'Richard Kahn"' 

Dear Richard, 

Please (Intl the remittance advice confirming payment released today In the amount of $8,532,000. 

All my best, 
Ceci 

Coolie Weaver I Sotheby's 
1: 
C: 
1334 York Avenue, New York, NY 10021 

From: Richard Kahn 
Sent Monday, September 25, 2017 9:18 AM 
To: Weaver, Cecilia 
Subject: Re: Giacometti terms 

mailto: 

please advise if wire was sent and provide amount and details 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
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fax 
cell 

On Sep 21, 2017, at 10:37 AM, Weaver, Cecilia a wrote: 

Dear Richard, 

Here is to confirm that payment will be made on Monday. 
I will send through the statement then, as soon as received. 

All my best, 
Cad 

From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Wednimday, September 20, 2017 2:03 PM 
To: Weaver, Cecilia 
Subject: Fwd: eacometti terms 

mato 

please confirm wire will be sent monday 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Weaver, Cecilia"
Subject: RE: Ciacometti terms 
Date: June 22.2017 at 11:27:58 AM EDT 
To: "'Dar 

K.Cc: "'Darren K. Indyke Esq. 

Dear all, 

a 'Richard Karla' 

Please find the sale statement attached for your records. 
Would you kindly also fill out the payment instruction form for the trust so we can have this on file in advance of the payout? 

Many thanks, 
Cea 

Cecilia Weaver I Sotheby's 
Assistant to Am Cappellazzo 
T. 
C: 
1334 York Avenue, New York, NY 10021 

From: Weaver, Cecilia 
Sent: Thursday, June 22, 2017 10:47 AN 
To: 'Heather Gray 
Cc: 'Darren K. Indylce Esq. ()'; Richard Kahn' 
Subject: RE: Giacometd terms 

Hi Heather, 

Here is to confirm that the purchaser was indeed the client who requested payment terms. 
Therefore, the payout will be 50% on day 95 (paid to us on day 90) and 50% on day 125 (paid to us on day 120). 

I hope you are happy with the result! 
Best, 
Ceci 
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Cecilia Weaver I Sotheby's 
Assistant to Amy Cappellazzo 
T: 
C: 
1334 York Avenue. New York. NY 10021 

From: Heather Gray IlOala 
Sent: Thursday, June 22, 2017 9:44 AN 
To: Weaver, Cecilia 
Cc: Damon K. Indyke Esq. ( ); Ridiard Kahn 
Subject: Giacometb terms 

HI Ced, 

I Just wanted to check In to see If the buyer of the Glacomettl was the person/entity who had requested extended payment terms, or If the trust should expect payment on day 35 (assuming Sotheby's has 
been paid by then, of course). 

Thanks! 
Heather 

Heather Gray 
Art Counsel 
Elysium Management LLC 
445 Park Avenue. Suite 1401 
New York, NY 10022 

fl
This amol and any nes kansminsa van n are consume and 
ireandad sd.Iy to Ma In oldie Individual or *nifty Ia unorn they 
en) adtenad aye° hewn received this eatl Al slot own* rally 
the postman.. at evaimsttosn. 

awnntliati m

EFTA00640751


