
From: Jeffrey <jeevacation@grnail.com> 

To: Craig Martin 

Subject: Fwd: Verado engine sale 

Date: Tue, 05 Jun 2012 03:54:47 +0000 

Sony for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: June 4, 2012 9:58:53 PM EDT 
To: jeevacation , mail.com 
Cc: 
Subject: Verado engine sale 

Jeffrey, 
Brice, Carlos, "Manuel" and Brian shipped the 3 Verado engine to west Palm beach so I may sell them, all of these people 
where involved, I have two of the Verado's sold for $10,000 as you know. When the engines arrived in Palm Beach the all 
gauges, Gauge wire harness and ignitions/keys where not in the engine crates as Brice told me. The past 24 hours, Brice 
and Carlos have been trying to locate them, Carlos told me he was 99% sure they where loaded in the crates. I asked Brice 
and Carlos, who exactly was the person to physically load the gauges, I never received a straight answer, each person 
pointed the finger at each other. I personally open the crates when they arrived in Florida, and did not see the gauges. 

These gauges have a new value of $5,200 and used set cost $2,700 
The current buyer wants us to provide, which would lower the price to $7,300 for both engines,. there is a cracked engine 
mount that needs to be replaced for $1,600 which the buyer has agreed to purchase. 

-would you accept $8,500 for the two engines, this way I can tell the buyer, we'll split the cost of the gauges with him and get 
rid of two Verado's? (I still have two 30 inch shaft Verado's to sell also). 

thank you, 
Larry 

EFTA00641803


