
From: Richard Kahn
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Appraisal Copy Request 
Date: Wed, 09 Aug 2017 19:28:54 +0000 

no sense of urgency after chasing him for this info since July 7th... 
very concerning... 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: David Mitchell <1 
Subject: Re: Appraisal Copy Request 
Date: August 9, 2017 at 2:54:49 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn •c 

will do 

DAVID MITCHELL 

Mitchell Holdings LLC 
801 Madison Avenue 
New York NY 10065 
USA 

On Aug 9, 2017, at 2:39 PM, Richard Kahn < wrote: 

still waiting on provenance info?? 
seems odd that sotheby's is taking so long.. 
please send insurance company report as well 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
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575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 

On Aug 3, 2017, at 7:44 AM, David Mitchell < 

It was part of the Estate , this is two items out the whole 
Digging through boxes , looking for it parallel efforts 

In addition insurance appraiser will complete his work next week 

DAVID MITCHELL 

Mitchell Holdings LLC 
801 Madison Avenue 
New York NY 10065 
USA 

> wrote: 

On Aug 3, 2017, at 7:38 AM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 

David i am confused as we were told this was part of the estate and expected a number today 
Not sure what happened as this letter to Sothebys could have been sent last week if you had nothing... 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

On Aug 3, 2017, at 6:46 AM, David Mitchell < > wrote: 
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They need a few days, 

DAVID MITCHELL 

Mitchell Holdings LLC 
745 Fifth Avenue, 5th Floor 
New York NY 10151 
USA 

From: David Mitchell 
Date: Wednesday, August 2, 2017 at 11:41 AM 
To:' 
Subject: Appraisal Copy Request 

Good morning, 

Please find attached letter requesting a copy of an appraisal done in 2010. 

Thank you so much, 

DAVID MITCHELL 

Mitchell Holdings LLC 
801 Madison Avenue 
New York NY 10065 
USA 
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