
From: Richard Kahn
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: JE 
Date: Thu, 09 Oct 2014 18:32:46 +0000 

Attachments: REVISED_EST_5161.pdf; Inv_34427_from_Dualoy_Leather_6892.pdf 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Gregory Riches
Date: October 9, 2014 at 2:25:51 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn
Subject: Fwd: JE 

Good afternoon Rich, 

Jeffrey approved these invoices yesterday for (4) custom chairs for 9 East 71st. 
JM Uphostery requires a 50% deposit to start the production. 

Also attaching is another invoice for the lambskin that these chairs will be covered in. 
Dualoy Leather requires the full amount. 

Any questions please let me know. 

Thank you. 
Gregory 

Gregory Riches 
INTERIORS 
43 West 28th #3 
NYC, NY 10001 

EFTA00644438


