
From: Larry Visoski 
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnad.com> 

Subject: Re: Josh 
Date: Fri, 24 Feb 2017 22:47:53 +0000 

I have not included any mention of 144 month items„ 
In order to obtain a price quote, Chevron has to give approval to Gulfstream in order to quote. 
Do you wish to include? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Feb 24, 2017, at 5:45 PM, jeffrey E. leevacation@en>  wrote: 

yes all around 

On Fri, Feb 24, 2017 at 5:38 PM, Larry Visoski 
Jeffrey 
Spoke to Josh 
Here's What transpired,. 

wrote: 

Chevron cannot come to Albuquerque to accomplish the TestFlight, 
I informed Josh we have a reservation for March 6 and Westfield any earlier they could not accommodate, 
***chevron called Westfield to check if they could take the aircraft early, Westfield told chevron March 6 is 
the earliest they can start the prebuy,. 
Chevron informs they will fly the G550 to Westfield Friday to arrive in he afternoon March 3, -
-they will keep their pilots overnight Friday night to accomplish the TestFlight March 4 Saturday, 
-Sunday night, Chevron will airline their maintenance chief Who was responsible for taking care of 5173 to 
Westfield, he will stay at Westfield until pre-buy is concluded. 
-Monday, March 6 input maintenance meeting for pre-by inspection at 9AM,. 

1-Josh requires our preBuy inspection work scope,. 

2-gulfstream Westfield requires signature for Prebuy Contract to lock in the March 6th start date„ Gulfstream 
requires deposit as well„ 50% 
Pre-buy premium package is $114k 

3-Josh awaits PA signing this weekend,. 

Pls advise if I should sign prebuy Premium package for $114k? And whether these test flight dates work for 
you? 

Thx, 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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