
From: "Jeanne Brennan Wiebracht" 

To: "'Jeffrey E."' <jeeyacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Anna's Salary 

Date: Mon, 29 Dec 2014 16:06:09 +0000 

Jeffrey 
Should I process Anna's $3000 monthly LSJE bonus for Dec ? 
Jeanne 

From: jeffrey E. [maikoleevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, November 25, 2014 2:13 PM 
To: Jeanne Brennan Wiebracht 
Subject: Re: FW: Anna's Salary 

yes 

On Tue, Nov 25, 2014 at 1:05 PM, Jeanne Brennan Wiebracht < 
Jeffrey 
Should I process Anna's $3000 monthly bonus for Nov? 
Jeanne 

> wrote: 

EFTA00645238


