From: Richard Kahn *—-}
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Re:
Date: Mon, 26 Jan 2015 21:49:26 +0000

no he is behind 4 payments x 4500 = 18,000
shall i send him or dominique or jeff fuller or all another email?
please advise

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.

On Jan 26, 2015, at 4:45 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(wgmail com™> wrote:

did jean luc pay his rent?
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