
From: "Rich Kahn" 

To: "Jeffrey epstein" <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Payroll Summary 

Date: Fri, 28 Jan 2011 17:25:34 +0000 

Attachments: Payroll_Summary_-_2010.pdf 

Rich Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 
New York, NY 10065 
tel 646-862-4811 
fax 
cell 

From: Jeffrey epstein [mailtoleevacation@gmail.corn] 
Sent: Friday, January 28, 2011 11:28 AM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject Re: RE: 

Everyones please 

Sony for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone 

On Jan 28, 2011, at 3:30 PM, "Rich Kahn" wrote: 

Darren Indyke 

2007 2008 2009 2010 

Hire date: 4/15/1996 
Salary - NYSG I DKI 1,714,900 1.462.163 1,448,615 1,432,000 
Salary - FTC 60,000 240.000 197,308 43,846 
Tax Free Distributions - DKI PLLC 125.000 150,000 -
Legal Fees (paid by JEE) 150,000 - -
401k -7% 15,500 16.000 -
Health / Dental / Life 16.426 16.426 18,766 20,676 
Payroll Taxes 30.446 27.091 27,329 27,522 
Gifts Ipad-4. 887 
Parking 5,400 5.400 5,400 5,400 
Loan - NYSG LLC 150.000 
Total 2.142.672 1,892,081 1.847.418 1.530.331 

2010 Base Salary 432,000 2009 Base Salary 448,615 
Lump 11/4/2010 250,000 Lump 9/24/2009 250,000 
Lump 712912010 250,000 Lump 6/4/2009 250,000 
Lump 4/2212010 250,000 Lump 4/09/2009 

r 

250,000 
Lump 1/14/2010 250,000 Lump 112912009 250 000 
Total 2010 Salary 1.432.000 Total 2009 Salary 1,448,615 

2009 had 1 extra pay period therefore salary was 
448,615 vs 432,000 

Rich Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 
New York, NY 10065 
tel 646.862-4811 
fax 646-350-0954 
cell 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeeyacationeogrnail.corn] 
Sent: Friday, January 28, 2011 4:10 AM 
To: Darren Indyke (AOL); Rich Kahn 
Subject: 
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we discussed giving me a total salary breakdown„ please email it to me , 

ONO 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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