
From: Richard Kahn

To: Jeffrey Epstein leevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Invoice 3372A from The Fiberglass Shop of Ft Lauderdale 

Date: Tue, 16 May 2017 01:03:24 +0000 

Attachments: Inv_3372Afrom_The_Fiberglass_Shop_Of Ft_Lauderdale_3152.pdf 

Not a great response below as total project approaches 300k. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
Tel 
Fax 
Cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Larry Visoski
Date: May 15, 2017 at 6:06:18 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn 
Cc: Darren Indyke 
Subject: Re: Invoice 3372A from The Fiberglass Shop of Ft Lauderdale 

I agree,. It is what it is„ 
If you can do that at some point I'd appreciate it„ 
I've been frustrated with his delays„ now the pricing„that should have been given up for approval long ago,. If I 
would have waited for his pricing,. Absolutely nothing would be done at this point„ 
He's almost done now, 
I can't wait to ship this project to STT„and get it in operation. 

Thx 
Lany 

Sent from my iPhone 

On May 16, 2017, at 12:01 AM, Richard Kahn > wrote: 

not sure what darren or i are supposed to say 
need details to call and obtain anything more than 10% off i negotiated in the past 

Begin forwarded message: 

EFTA00648577



From: Lvjet <MMI > 
Date: May 15, 2017 at 5:36:10  PM EDT 
To: 
Subject: Fwd: Invoice 3372A from The Fiberglass Shop of Ft Lauderdale 

you or Darren call him about these rites.,.. 
Richards Cell phone 

 Original Message 
From: Sales < 
To: Ivjet < 
Cc: sales < 
Sent: Mon. May 15. 2017 3:25 pm 
Subject: FW: Invoice 3372A from The Fiberglass Shop of Ft Lauderdale 

Larry, 
Attached please find the active work order with detailed descriptions. Sorry about the delay sir. 
Please call me should you have any questions. 
Warmest regards. 
Richard. 

The Fiberglass Shop of Ft. Lauderdale Corp. 

2001 SW 20th Street, Bay 120 
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33315 

office) 
fax) 
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