
From: jeffrey epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
To: Rich Kahn

Subject: Re: Funding your personal account 
Date: Mon, 20 Dec 2010 16:52:35 +0000 

You never presented the salaries and benefits 

Sony for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 20, 2010, at 12:48 PM, "Rich Kahn" < > wrote: 

Do I have your permission to fund your account from FTC JP Morgan with 1,000,000 as the balance in account 
is 125,738 and I have to pay LSJ credit card in the amount of 181,103. The last time we funded was on 
12/8/2010 (see attached PDF file). 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 

New York, NY 10065 

tel 

fax 

cel 

<JEE Spending 12-8-2010 - 12-20-2010.pdf> 
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