
From: Richard Kahn 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@grnail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: hey rich checking on this check ( thank you -scoff ) 
Date: Mon, 11 Jul 2011 19:07:25 +0000 

Attachments: Invoice_JE-1403-1818.pdf 

please advise if ok to pay invoice in the amount of 992.50 

scott under billed by 240.00 in our favor 
(8 hours x 75 should be 600 - he billed 360) 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 1OF 
New York, NY 10065 
tel 646-862-4811 
fax 646-350-0954 
cell 917-414-7584 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Scott Denett 
Date: July 11, 2011 8:19:35 AM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: hey rich checking on this check ( thank you -scoft ) 

EFTA00649289


