
From: Richard Kahn 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Fri, 30 Nov 2012 21:06:19 +0000 

My records show that he was paid $1,750 as a contracted carpenter for original scope of work that was 
performed over the following periods: Oct 15th - Oct 20th and Oct 22nd - Oct 27th 
Brice has made reference that i have been presented with another invoice and am refusing to pay which is not the 
case.. 
Please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 
fax 
Cel 

On Nov 30, 2012, at 3:49 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

separate from my approval of 17oo dolloars for dave how much has he been paiid and under what 
understanding 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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