
From: Brad Wechsler <1 
To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Sat, 26 Dec 2015 23:47:27 +0000 

That makes sense to me. Let me coordinate with joe on logistics. Hope all is well. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 26, 2015, at 11:21 AM, jeffrey E. leesiattiegmail.com> wrote: 

I suggest that after the sale of noel calb for the 260. leon then pays 10 m personally to stc , return 250 to 
bank, 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
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including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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