
From: Richard Kahn

To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: 

Date: Mon, 23 Jan 2017 21:42:27 +0000 

please advise if 5k usd wire ok to send 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

On Jan 23, 2017, at 4:37 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 

because I gave you not correct information about my bank account, as I have known today from my bank 
manager, those one is just for Russian, we need to use this one -  it is for abroad 
money transfer. Information about bank was right. I do apologize for the inconvenience. 5k! 
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