
From: Richard Kahn 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Tyler 
Date: Wed, 12 Feb 2014 15:33:36 +0000 

Tyler is concerned that we will lose National Geographic article if we do not commit today. 
His invoice outstanding invoice is 13,411 for Dec 2013 & Jan 2014. 
What do you think of sending him 8,000 or 10,000 to keep him working... 
Please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
to 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Tyler Shears •cl 
Subject: Billing Update 
Date: February 11, 2014 9:13:59 AM EST 
To: Richard Kahn 

Hi Richard, 

Just wanted to touch base to see if you have heard from Mr. Epstein on our last invoice. We have National 
Geographic lined up for this week and are in process of submitting - I want to make sure all is well before 
adding more expenses. 

This is becoming an urgent matter in relation to getting results for Mr. Epstein. I need to have the confidence to 
keep moving forward to hit the goal established the last conversation we had. 

Please advise. 

Sincerely, 

Tyler Shears 
Shears Consulting Group 
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