
From: 

To: bellaklein < 

Cc: Lesley Groff <lesley.jee@gmail.com> 

Bcc: jeevacation@gmail.com 

Subject: Re: Dr. Magnani 

Date: Wed, 11 Dec 2013 21:16:05 +0000 

Yes that is right .JE has aproved it. Thanks 

On Wednesday, December 11, 2013, bellaklein wrote: 
Hi 
Please confirm attached invoice from Dr. Magnani. Did JE approved your visit? 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: Message from KMBT_C253 
Date: December 11, 2013 1:12:01 PM EST 
To: 
Reply-To: 

EFTA00651459


