vrom

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Re: William DiMauro Pilot Expenses
Date: Tue, 22 Oct 2013 08:30:34 +0000

| think you must be referring to an unfinished conversation. | don't know why you chose to involve Rich

at this point, or expected me to comply with his random emails without any clarification.

On Tuesday, October 22, 2013 12:44 AM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationi@gmail.com= wrote:
ill call you today. not sure why you are playing

On Mon, Oct 21, 2013 at 1:17 PM,_ wrote:

PRPPPIVIPPPVIIV?

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Richard Kahn <
Date: October 21, 2013, 12:26:42 PM EDT
To:
Subject: William DiMauro Pilot Expenses

Attached are 4 seperate invoices for William totaling 16,129.01

Can you please make payment and let me know when check is ready to be sent out
Please feel free to call me with any questions

Thank you

Richard Kahn
HBERK. Associates Inc.
o275 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor,

Begin forwarded message:

From: [N

Subject: Message from KMBT_C253
Date: October 21, 2013 :41:07 AM EDT
To

Reply-To: |
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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