
From: Brad Wechsler 

To: mjeevacation@gmail.comm <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Fwd: FW: Updated depreciation 

Date: Mon, 14 Sep 2015 03:42:18 +0000 

Yes...disappointed it took us as long as it did; apologies. Last delay was establishing 4/14 valuation (date plane was put 
into service for purposes of pt 135). You shld speak to alan and rich tomorrow...l'm obviously available as well, tho only in 
office for limited part of day. Welcome back, B 

From: Jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmall.com] 
Sent: Sunday, September 13, 2015 10:18 PM 
To: Brad Wechsler 
Subject: Fwd: FW: Updated depreciation 

just returned to new york. not sure why it took so long 
 Forwarded message   
From: Richard Joslin 
Date: Fri, Sep 11, 2015 at 6:34 PM 
Subject: FW: Updated depreciation 
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Cc: "Dlugash,e, Brad Wechsler 
Castrucci 

,John 

I sent this revised Avioneta draft earlier to Alan. Latest revision has updated depreciation. I also gave to Alan 
DRB Productions return and workpapers. We spent several hours today going over the returns including 
Avioneta. With regard to the various entities, he has indicated he is in general agreement but wishes to continue 
to review and discuss with you. I stand ready over the weekend to discuss or add additional information. The 
BJAV and Avioneta return reporting was based on input from aviation and maritime attorneys and Rick 
Bronstein of Paul Weiss. 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation®gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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www.imax.com 
IMAXI9 is a registered trademark of IMAX Corporation 

IMPORTANT NOTICE 
Information contained in this e-mail correspondence and any attachments is confidential information intended only for the use of the individual or entity named 
above. 
Any reader of this message who is not the intended recipient of this correspondence is hereby notified that any dissemination. distribution. copying 
or communication of the contents of this correspondence is strictly prohibited. If this e-mail was not addressed to you . please immediately notify us 
by phone in Canada at (905) 403-6500 (collect calls will be accepted) or by email at webmaster@imax.com and delete and destroy this 
correspondence inadvertently sent to you. Thank you 
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