
From: Brice
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Dennis Barrett 
Date: Fri, 01 Feb 2013 18:39:41 +0000 

Yes 

Brice M Gordon 

On Feb 1, 2013, at 2:18 PM, Jeffrey Epstein leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

was more material used. ? 

On Fri, Feb 1, 2013 at 1:42 PM, Brice cl > wrote: 
Jeffrey has just approved 

Brice M Gordon 

On Feb 1, 2013, at 1:07 PM, Richard Kahn c 

Brice, 

> wrote: 

Please obtain JEE approval in your meeting for balance outstanding of 8,060. 

Original Quote 13,200 
Less: Deposit (8,500) 

Subtotal 4,700 
add: change order 1360 
Total Due 8,060 

Change order came about when great room cistern was emptied it was discovered it had 3 chamber and not 
1 as estimated 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 
fa 
ce 

Begin forwarded message: 

EFTA00652857



From: 
Date: February 1, 2013 10:47:10 AM EST 
To: 
Subject: Messa e from KMBT C253 
Reply-To: 

<SICMBT_C25313020111460.pdf> 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

EFTA00652858


