From: Boris Nikolic <|}

To: leffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com=
Subject: RE: Biosys Balances
Date: Tue, 14 Apr 2015 22:59:03 +0000
Importance: Normal

Just got back from Brazil!

Can you talk any time today or tmr or Thursday?

| need to double check - | think that the initial balance was 250K total. 100K spent (or so) should also go toward
the offset the balance.

But please let me check that.

Also | am NOT interested in using URL and Biosys name. | had discussion previously and they were super
difficult (and expensive - wanted to charge me premium - re that) so | will not use it.

THANK YOU

Date: Tue, 14 Apr 2015 14:50:30 -0400
Subject: Re: Biosys Balances
From: jeevacation@gmail.com

To: I

i assume that means you can use it twoards the 250k?

On Tue, Apr 14, 2015 at 2:44 PM, Peter L. Corsell <} R rote:

Hi Jeffrey,

The cash balances in the Biosys accounts at SunTrust are as follows:

Biosys Capital Management, LLC has 5103,485.22

Biosys Capital Partners, LP has 549,652.35

Just fyi, these balances do not take into account travel expenses or the cost of the Biosys URL.

Also, | assume that Boris would want sole ownership of the name and the URL in a settlement scenario.

All the best,
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Peter

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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