
From: Erika Kellerhals < 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@grnail.com> 

Subject: Re: spoke with Rohrlick 
Date: Sat, 19 May 2012 22:14:06 +0000 

It's like having a conversation with a petulant child. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On May 19, 2012, at 5:36 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

cannot have a figure off of gross reveinu.. worst case large revenue„ no profit, and still pay . also gives too 
many people access to books. we discussed this on the first call 

On Sat, May 19, 2012 at 9:43 PM, Erika Kellerhals < > wrote: 
That's fine. Let me look at my schedule and we can figure something out but I may do first go around. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On May 19, 2012, at 3:22 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

I am on wurope time, tomorrow.? I think you are going to have the first tough conversation first. 

On Sat, May 19, 2012 at 9:18 PM, Erika Kellerhals < > wrote: 
I didn't — I figured we would save it for when he pushed back. 

III revisit for alternatives. On another note — I am meeting with David Hall, President of UVI, week after next as I spoke 
to the Director of Development at UVI and told him that UVI should get the per annum payments from the RT Park 
companies directly and not the RT Park — he didn't even know they were not getting the money directly. 

ERIKA A. KELLERHALS 
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From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Date: Saturday, May 19, 2012 3:12 PM 
To: Erika Kellerhals 
Subject: Re: spoke with Rohrlick 

di we tel him we know he lies ? gross rveinue is out of the quesiton. 

On Sat, May 19, 2012 at 7:44 PM, Erika Kellerhals c wrote: 
Finally hunted down Rohrlick from RT Park. He indicated the Board will want a percentage rather than the flat fees 
proposed of $100K $200K and $300K. By way of example - he claimed on company which projected $30M in revenue 
a year — paid $350K upfront with .05% of gross revenues per annum payable to the RT Park. Another company which 
projected $5M per annum did $150K upfront plus 1% of gross revenues per annum. Thoughts? 

I am headed overseas — email is best — we can set up a call if you like — but email me first and we can confirm times. 

ERIKA A. ICELLERHALS 

PLEASE NOTE OUR NEW ADDRESS BELOW 
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