
From: Richard Kahn 

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Fwd: RE: 

Date: Tue, 24 Apr 2012 15:12:18 +0000 

I found this old email i sent you Feb 28, 2011 that refers to the Rock Crusher and Brice claiming we would have 
to pay to have Rock Crusher removed from LSJ but Manuel offered them $1,000 so they sold it to them 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 1OF 
New York, NY 10065 
tel 

Date: February 28, 2011 5:03:50 PM EST 
To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeeyacation@grnail.com>
Subject: RE: 

a) Nick Lambros — I called him once on Friday, Saturday and Sunday asking him to talk so we can work this out 
and have no response. I forwarded all paperwork to Darren for his letter. Should I continue to call? 

b) Rock Crusher — Brice claims that you instructed him to clean up the island and get rid of old stuff. He said that 
they would have had to pay to get rock crusher off the island but Manuel the mechanic offered them $ 1,000 
for it and they have not done a bill of sale as of yet. As far as the generators they have not sold them as of yet 
but are fielding offers right now. 

c) I will review Rich B proposals and get Merwin input on Marble Cleaner 
d) Flight Options 

Rich Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 
New York, NY 10065 
tel 
fax 
cel 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeeyacation@gmall.com] 
Sent: Monday, February 28, 2011 11:18 AM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: 

did you get an answer on the sale f crusher.? nick lambros.? review barnetess various proposals.. ask merwyn 
if he has a marble cleaner for example. 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
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constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to 
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