
From: Andrea Pfanzelter 

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Gates Foundation 

Date: Wed, 24 Apr 2013 10:07:11 +0000 

Sony, Sony Jeff!!! ... After Talking this morning to Terje I have sent my email answer already to Rob... What 
todo now? 
Andrea 

On Apr 24, 2013, at 12:00, "Jeffrey Epstein" lea®gmail.com>  wrote: 

Dear Rob, 

Thank you for our discussion last night on the telephone, as well as your email below. We will begin 
to work on a framework agreement covering the parameters of any future collaberation . However, 
with your consent I have given the go ahead for our staff member to travel to Pakistan on 26 April, 
with the understanding that the costs of this mission will be reimbursed . 

Thanks 

Andrea 

On Wed, Apr 24, 2013 at 4:54 AM, Andrea Pfanzelter < 

FYI 

Andrea 

From: Andrea Pfanzelter 
Sent: Mittwoch, 24. April 2013 10:54 
To: 'Robert Rosen' 
Cc: Terje Rod-Larsen; Walter Kemp
Subject: Gates Foundation 

Dear Rob, 

wrote: 

Thank you for our discussion last night on the telephone, as well as your email below. We understand 
the need to work on a framework agreement covering the parameters of our engagement. In order to 
get this process moving, please let me know the steps and timelines required from our side. In the 
meantime, because of the urgency of the situation, we are operating under the assumption that we 
should go ahead with the deployment of our staff member to Pakistan on 26 April, and that the costs 
of this mission will be covered by you. 

Thanks 
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Andrea 

Andrea Pfanzelter 

Director - IPI Vienna 

International Peace Institute 

Freyung 3/2/14 

1010 Vienna 

Tel. 

From: Robert Rosen [mailto:Robert.Rosen gatesfoundation.org]
Sent: Dienstag, 23. April 2013 21:41 
To: Andrea Pfanzelter 
Subject: Gates Foundation 

Andrea, 

We found the conversation in Strasbourg invaluable and definitely plan to formalize an engagement for IPI to 
provide strategic counsel and support to the Gates Foundation's polio eradication strategy. We should make 
sure we work together to define the parameters of the engagement including fees and expenses as quickly as 
possible. We understand that this will include expenses associated with travel into our key areas of focus in 
preparation for any reports and/or briefings prepared by IPI for the Gates Foundation. 

Thanks, 

Rob 

Robert Rosen 
Director, Executive Office 
V +1 206 770 1844 
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C +1 206 883 7936 
E robert.rosen@gatesfoundation.org

BILL & MELINDA GATES fonndafion 

www.gatesfoundation.org

***** ************************* ***************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to 

EFTA00657239


