
From: Richard Kahn 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Thu, 28 Apr 2011 19:57:59 +0000 

ok i will send now - do i have your permission to fund 1,000,000 from ftc as balance in your account is 85,338. 
the last time we funded was April 1st. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 
New York. NY 10065 

On Apr 28, 2011, at 3:52 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

pay roy 100k, call dee craig 
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