From: Brad Wechsler <[ -
To: "jeevacation(@ gmail.com' <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Re:
Date: Tue, 17 Feb 2015 20:18:32 +0000

Just confirmed with rich j. We'll wire out asap.

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, February 17, 2015 03:13 PM
To: Brad Wechsler; Richard Joslin <[ G-

Subject:

to confirm toms total bill down from 522 to be paid 500k

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential. may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and 1s intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof 1s strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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IMAXE is a registerad trademark of IMAX Corporation
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