
From: 
To: "Je vacation" <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: Fw: GV s/n 634 
Date: The, 27 Nov 2012 20:36:08 +0000 

Importance: Normal 
Attachments: 634 Floor_plan.pdf; GV_JPA_Specs.doc 

Sean wanted me to fwd this GV to you. 
He said Jack Pruitt has listing, Sean thinks $18M- $18.250K 
5500 total time 
1550 landings 
Mid divan, Not aft. 
Sent via BlackDeny by AT&T 

From: "Sean J Lancaster" < 
Date: Tue, 27 Nov 2012 12:38:28 -0500 
To: 
ReplyTo: 
Subject: FW: GV s/n 634 

Best regards, 

Sean J. Lancaster 
Bristol Associates Inc. 

direct 
ext 1130 Main Office 
Mobile 

li FAX 
UK Mobile 

P. www.bristolassociates.com 
;image 

This message may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please 
destroy it. Any unauthorized dissemination, distribution or copying of the material in this message. and any attachments to the message. is 
strictly forbidden. (c) 2012 aN rights resolved. 

From: Renee Prewitt 
Sent: Tuesday, November 27, 2012 12:36 PM 
To: 
Subject: GV s/n 634 

Dear Sean, 
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Hope all is well...I wanted to give you a heads up in regards to GV s/n 634. I plan to advertise the new ask price of 
$19.5 million next week. The owner wants the aircraft gone! Let me know if you might have an interest in the 
aircraft.thanks! 

With optimism, 
Renee 

Renee Prewitt 
Vice President 
Jack Prewitt & Associates, Inc. 

O 
C 

Over 1000 Aircraft Sold 
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CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE 
This e-mail message may contain confidential or proprietary information intended only for use by the intended recipient. If you are 
not the intended recipient of this e-mail, please be aware that any use, reproduction, distribution or disclosure of this e-mail or any 
information contained herein is prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error, please notify Jack Prewitt & Associates, Inc. 
immediately and delete this e-mail and all attachments from your computer system. Thank you 
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