
From: 

To: "Rich Kahn" < Ila>, "Je vacation" leevacation®gmail.cotn> 

Subject: Fw: Invoice N908JE 

Date: Mon, 05 Mar 2012 14:21:45 +0000 

Importance: Normal 

Attachments: 21219-DEPARTURE.pdf 

Jeffrey, 
$294,905.77 is Boeing 727 completion invoice at FlightStar, need wire sent today after JE approval, for release 
of Boeing, I plan test flight today at 4pm,. 
Is this approved for Rich to Wire funds to flightStar? 

Thank you, 
Larry 
Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 

From: "Tiffany Clevinger" 
Date: Fri. 2 Mar 2012 16:11:11 -0500 
To: - 
Cc: 'Steve 
Subject: Invoice N908JE 

Please see attached invoice, if you have any questions or concerns feel free to contact me. 

Thank you, 

Tiffany Clevinger 
Billing Manager 
Fli htstar Aircraft Services, LLC 

ext. 247 
Fax: 

EFTA00659560


