
From: 

To: "Je vacation" <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: Fw: NewDocument 

Date: Sat, 28 Apr 2012 15:09:59 +0000 

Importance: Normal 

Attachments: NewDocument.pdf 

Paul has accepted 407,,,just owe him an anti ice valve„estimate $4500,,,we don't pay,,,,broker pays 
Heading to Wilmington now 

Sent via BlacicBerry by AT&T 

 Original Message 
From: Paul Schreuder lala> 
Date: Sat, 28 Apr 2012 10:02:51 
To: Darren Indyke ; Larry Visoskic 
Subject: NewDocument 

Please see the attached. Paul 
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