
From: Alireza Ittihadieh 

To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: BBJ YG006 

Date: Thu, 09 Oct 2014 11:59:42 +0000 

The Owner will take $25M now and will give you upto 6 months to sell the 727. If the 727 is not sold you pay 
him the additional $3M 

Thoughts 

V-BR 
Alireza ITTIHADIEH 
President & Chief Executive 

From: Jeffrey E. 
Sent: Wednesday, 8 October 2014 03:49 
To: Alireza Ittihadieh 
Subject: 

at 5-7 million for new interior with all new wood. electric window shades, entertainment, bulheads for bed, and 
new shower , 25 is the right price, sorry, Im happy to give him a lien on the 727 , but one thing for sure , the 
value of his plane is not going up. I appreciate you trying to put something together, 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation®gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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