
From:
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Tue, 29 Dec 2015 01:04:00 +0000 

Thank you! 

On Monday, December 28, 2015, Jeffrey E. <jea®gmail.com> wrote: 
Yes 

On Mon, Dec 28, 2015 at 7:51 PM, > wrote: 
Hello Jeffrey! I asked Bella to rewire some money back for what I've spent for work as food and as taxi 
expenses and then money for the Aspen trip expenses-sport clothing and our new year eve tickets concert 
which you approved 

Is it ok with you? 

----- Forwarded message --------
From: bellaklein  
Date: Monday, December 28, 2015 

To: 

Please ask JE to approve your personal expenses. I can reimburse only JE expenses and your medical - $ 
1160.81. Going forward, I would appreciate if you submit your personal expenses as attached below with JE 
approval. 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation®gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

EFTA00662059


