From: Lesley Groff *_-f*
To: Jeffrey Epstein *_?f
Subject: Fwd: Joe Thakuria
Date: Mon, 03 Mar 2014 19:15:58 +0000

below from Rich

Begin forwarded message:

From: Richard Kahn </ -

Subject: Re: Joe Thakuria
Date: March 3, 2014 2:10:35 PM EST
To: Lesley Groff <

no - my previous email to him asked that and he did not say he was ready
per Joe in last email:

Hi Richard, my study 1s still awaiting irb approval at mgh. Once that goes through, there'll be a consent form
for Jeffrey to review and sign and then I can forward the invoice from [llumina for the rapid turn-around-time
whole genome.

Richard Kahn

HERK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor,
New York, New York 10022

On Mar 3, 2014, at 2:08 PM, Lesley Gmﬂ"*_‘«* wrote:
Hi Rich...see below..
Begin forwarded message:

From: Jeffrey Epstein </ RGN

Subject: Re: Joe Thakuria

Date: March 3, 2014 2:06:32 PM EST

To: Lesley Groff <

did we send him the money/?

On Mon, Mar 3, 2014 at 1:28 PM, Lesley Gmﬂ"‘f_l'-* wrote:

Joe requested I send you the below:

Thanks, if vou could also pass on to Jeffrey: The YPO folks are also awaiting this MGH IRB approval
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along with him for work beyond the DNA extraction. They will need to get re-consented and may even
need to resubmit samples under the new protocol. Assuming it goes through, they will have their exomes

sequenced while Jeffrey will have his full genome sequenced.

Joe Thakuria
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(a gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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